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(BETA DRAFT)TERMS OF USE 

 
 
NOTICE: BY USING THE PV VALUE® WEB APPLICATION SOFTWARE, YOU ARE AGREEING TO 
BE BOUND BY THE FOLLOWING TERMS OF USE: 
 
ENERGY SENSE FINANCE, LLC. OR ITS SUCCESSOR, HEREIN AFTER REFERRED TO AS ("ESF").   
 
PV VALUE® WEB APPLICATION SOFTWARE LICENSE AGREEMENT ("LICENSE") 
Single User License 
 
IMPORTANT: PLEASE READ THIS WEB APPLICATION SOFTWARE LICENSE AGREEMENT 
CAREFULLY BEFORE USING THE WEB APPLICATION SOFTWARE, REGISTRATION OR LOGIN 
FUNCTIONS ACCOMPANYING THIS LICENSE. BY USING THE WEB APPLICATION, REGISTERING 
OR LOGGING IN TO PV VALUE®, AS APPLICABLE, YOU ARE AGREEING TO BE BOUND BY THE 
TERMS OF THIS LICENSE. IF YOU DO NOT AGREE TO THE TERMS OF THIS LICENSE, DO NOT 
USE THE PV VALUE® WEB APPLICATION SOFTWARE, REGISTRATION OR LOGIN FUNCTIONS. 
 
THIS WEB APPLICATION SOFTWARE IS OFFERED FREE OF CHARGE FOR LIMITED PERSONAL 
OR COMMERCIAL USE IF ACCESSED THROUGH THE WEB APPLICATION GRAPHICAL USER 
INTERFACE. USE AT YOUR OWN RISK. NO WARRANTY OF ANY KIND IS EXPRESSED OR 
IMPLIED. 
 
1. General.  
(a) The web application software, content, data, interfaces and documentation including the valuation wiki 
that is accessible through the web application software is licensed, not sold, to you by ESF for use only 
under the terms of this License. ESF and its licensors retain ownership of the Web Application Software 
itself and reserve all rights not expressly granted to you. 
 
(b) The name PV Value® is registered as a trademark with the U.S. Patent and Trademark Office and 
may not be used for personal or commercial purposes outside of the web application software without the 
expressed written permission of ESF. 
 
(c) The algorithms used within the web application software are copyrighted by ESF through a direct 
copyright claim along with a direct copyright recognized and granted through the U.S. Dept. of Energy 
and may not be used for personal or commercial purposes outside of the web application software 
without the expressed written permission of ESF. 
 
(d) The name Ei Value™ is a trademarked name of ESF and may not be used for personal or commercial 
purposes outside of the web application software without the expressed written permission of ESF. 
 
(e) The valuation wiki is available for registered users of the web application software and is jointly 
maintained by ESF and the U.S. Dept. of Energy’s Sandia National Laboratories. It is updated periodically 
as content becomes available.  You may download a copy of the journal articles or white papers for your 
own use as long as copyright notices are maintained within the downloaded articles.  Linking directly to 
articles is prohibited and will result in an error if not logged in to the web application software. 
 
2. Permitted License Uses and Restrictions.   
(a) Subject to the terms and conditions of this License, you are granted a limited non-exclusive license to 
use the Web Application Software on one single device at a time. Unless as provided in a separate 
agreement between you and ESF, this License does not allow the Web Application Software or its 
copyrighted algorithms to exist within your own software or be branded within your own name separately 
from the Web Application Software, and you may not distribute access to the Web Application Software 
for commercial purposes or allow your login credentials to be used by others for personal or commercial 
purposes. 
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(b) You may not, and you agree not to or enable others to, copy (except as expressly permitted by this 
License), decompile, reverse engineer, disassemble, attempt to derive the source code of, decrypt, 
modify, or create derivative works of the Web Application Software or any services provided by the Web 
Application Software or any part thereof (except as and only to the extent any foregoing restriction is 
prohibited by applicable law or by licensing terms governing use of open-source components that may be 
included with the Web Application Software). 
 
(c) By creating a PDF, capturing the screen, printing the screen, or storing data within the Web 
Application you are making a disclosure of data. In some jurisdictions, it is unlawful to disclose certain 
consumer data to a third party without prior permission from the consumer or proper disclosure to the 
consumer of the potential for data disclosure. By using the Web Application Software you agree that you 
are authorized or legally permitted to disclose the data and all legal disclosure requirements have been 
met. If you are a consumer user of the Web Application Software for your own purposes, by using the 
Web Application Software you agree to allow for the storage and use of the data within the Web 
Application Software for all legally allowed purposes. 
 
(d) You agree to use the Web Application in compliance with all applicable laws, including local laws of 
the state/territory or county in which you reside or in which you use the Web Application Software. 
 
3. Transfer. You may not rent, lease, lend, sell, redistribute, or sublicense the Web Application Software 
or your login credentials.  
 
4. Consent to Use of Data.  
(a) Diagnostic and Usage Data. You agree that ESF and may collect, maintain, process and use 
diagnostic, technical, usage and related information, including but not limited to unique system, software 
or hardware identifiers, information about your tablet, web enabled phone, computer or other web based 
access device that is gathered periodically to provide and improve ESF’s products and services, facilitate 
the web application software updates, product support related to the Web Application Software, and to 
verify compliance with the terms of this License. ESF may use this information for any or all of the 
purposes described above.  
 
(b) Location Data. ESF, Google maps through their Google map API, and other third party data providers 
may provide certain services through the web application software that rely upon location information. To 
provide and improve these services where available, ESF, Google maps and third party data providers 
may transmit, collect, maintain, process and use your location data, including the real-time geographic 
location where you are accessing the web and of where you use the web application software. The 
location data and queries collected by ESF are collected in a form that does not personally identify you 
and may be used by ESF, Google maps and other third party data providers to provide and improve 
location-based products and services. By using any location-based services in the web application 
software, you agree and consent to ESF's, Google maps’ and other third party data providers’ 
transmission, collection, maintenance, processing and use of your location data and queries to provide 
and improve such products and services.  Google’s privacy policy may be accessed at 
http://www.google.com/policies/privacy/ 
 
(c) Data stored within web application software. By using the web application software, you agree that 
ESF may store data input by you or uploaded by you from your web enabled device in perpetuity and 
automatically make the data available to the web application software on demand including but not limited 
to the PV Value® and Ei Value™ web application software. The web application software will allow you to 
save, modify or remove the data from your viewport through the graphical user interface to improve the 
accessibility and validity of the data and your own unique user experience; however, the data may not 
always be deleted from the database even if it is removed by you from your own unique viewport within 
the web application software. It is important to note that some of the same data is already contained 
within the local permitting authority and county assessor databases and available to the public through 
broad public record laws. 
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(d) Advertising. ESF may provide interest-based advertising to you through the web application software. 
Although we do not currently have plans to show interest-based advertising through the web application 
software, you are hereby notified that we may do so in the future without any further notice. 
 
(e) Privacy Policy. At all times your information will be treated in accordance with ESF’s Privacy Policy, 
which is incorporated by reference into this License and can be viewed at: https://www.pvvalue.com. 
 
5. Third Party Service Providers.   
(a) The Web Application Software may enable access to the Google Maps API, Rooftop Lidar imaging 
services and other ESF and third party services and web sites. Use of these Services requires Internet 
access and may require you to accept additional terms and conditions at the time of use.   
 
(b) You understand that by using any of the Services, you may encounter content that may be deemed 
offensive, indecent, or objectionable, which content may or may not be identified as having explicit 
language, and that the results of any address or property search or entering of a unique property id may 
automatically and unintentionally generate links or references to objectionable material. Nevertheless, 
you agree to use the Services at your sole risk and that ESF shall have no liability to you for content that 
may be found to be offensive, indecent, or objectionable.  
 
(c) Neither ESF nor any of its content providers guarantees the availability, accuracy, completeness, 
reliability, or timeliness of utility rate data, utility escalation rate data, interest rate data, investment rates 
of return data, discount rate data, location data, valuation data, estimated kWh data, or any other data 
displayed by any Services.  Data displayed is for general informational purposes only and should not be 
relied upon as investment or valuation advice. The web application software is not an appraisal 
replacement tool and users are encouraged to seek the services of a competent, knowledgeable and 
properly licensed valuation professional. 
 
(d) If you upload any content such as logo’s or pictures regardless of format, you represent that you own 
all rights for, or have authorization or are otherwise legally permitted to upload, such content and that 
such content does not violate any terms of service elsewhere. You agree that the web application 
software contains proprietary content, information and material that is owned by ESF and/or their 
licensors, and is protected by applicable intellectual property and other laws, including but not limited to 
copyright and trademark. You agree that you will not use such proprietary content, information or 
materials other than for permitted use of the web application software or in any manner that is 
inconsistent with the terms of this License or that infringes any intellectual property rights of a third party 
or ESF. No portion of the web application software may be reproduced in any form or by any means. You 
agree not to modify, rent, lease, loan, sell, distribute, or create derivative works based on the web 
application software, in any manner, and you shall not exploit the web application software in any 
unauthorized way whatsoever, including but not limited to, using the web application software to transmit 
any computer viruses, worms, trojan horses or other malware, or by trespass or burdening network 
capacity. You further agree not to use the web application software in any manner to harass, abuse, stalk, 
threaten, defame or otherwise infringe or violate the rights of any other party, and that ESF is not in any 
way responsible for any such use by you using the web application software. 
 
6. Termination. This License is effective until terminated. Your rights under this License will terminate 
automatically or otherwise cease to be effective without notice from ESF if you fail to comply with any 
term(s) of this License. Upon the termination of this License, you shall cease all use of the Web 
Application Software.  Sections 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 12 and 13 of this License shall survive any such 
termination. 
 
7. Disclaimer of Warranties.  
7.1     If you are a customer who is a consumer (someone who uses the Web Application Software 
outside of your trade, business or profession), you may have legal rights which would prohibit the 
following limitations from applying to you, and where prohibited they will not apply to you. To find out 
more about rights, you should contact a local consumer advice organization. 
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7.2     YOU EXPRESSLY ACKNOWLEDGE AND AGREE THAT, TO THE EXTENT PERMITTED BY 
APPLICABLE LAW, USE OF THE WEB APPLICATION SOFTWARE AND ANY SERVICES 
PERFORMED BY OR ACCESSED THROUGH THE WEB APPLICATION SOFTWARE IS AT YOUR 
SOLE RISK AND THAT THE ENTIRE RISK AS TO SATISFACTORY QUALITY, PERFORMANCE, 
ACCURACY AND EFFORT IS WITH YOU.  
 
7.3     TO THE MAXIMUM EXTENT PERMITTED BY APPLICABLE LAW, THE WEB APPLICATION 
SOFTWARE AND THIRD-PARTY SERVICES ARE PROVIDED "AS IS" AND "AS AVAILABLE", WITH 
ALL FAULTS AND WITHOUT WARRANTY OF ANY KIND, AND ESF AND ESF'S LICENSORS 
(COLLECTIVELY REFERRED TO AS "ESF" FOR THE PURPOSES OF SECTIONS 7 AND 8) HEREBY 
DISCLAIM ALL WARRANTIES AND CONDITIONS WITH RESPECT TO THE WEB APPLICATION 
SOFTWARE AND SERVICES, EITHER EXPRESS, IMPLIED OR STATUTORY, INCLUDING, BUT NOT 
LIMITED TO, THE IMPLIED WARRANTIES AND/OR CONDITIONS OF MERCHANTABILITY, 
SATISFACTORY QUALITY, FITNESS FOR A PARTICULAR PURPOSE, ACCURACY, AND NON-
INFRINGEMENT OF THIRD PARTY RIGHTS.  
 
7.4     ESF DOES NOT WARRANT AGAINST INTERFERENCE, THAT THE FUNCTIONS CONTAINED 
IN, OR SERVICES PERFORMED OR PROVIDED BY, THE WEB APPLICATION SOFTWARE WILL 
MEET YOUR REQUIREMENTS, THAT THE OPERATION OF THE WEB APPLICATION SOFTWARE 
AND SERVICES WILL BE UNINTERRUPTED OR ERROR-FREE, THAT ANY THIRD-PARTY SERVICE 
WILL CONTINUE TO BE MADE AVAILABLE, THAT DEFECTS IN THE WEB APPLICATION 
SOFTWARE OR SERVICES WILL BE CORRECTED, OR THAT THE WEB APPLICATION SOFTWARE 
WILL BE COMPATIBLE OR WORK WITH ANY THIRD PARTY SOFTWARE, APPLICATIONS OR 
THIRD-PARTY SERVICES. USAGE OF THIS WEB APPLICATION SOFTWARE MAY AFFECT THE 
USABILITY OF THIRD PARTY SOFTWARE, APPLICATIONS OR THIRD PARTY SERVICES WHEN 
EXPORTING OR IMPORTING DATA OUT OF OR IN TO THE WEB APPLICATION SOFTWARE.  
 
7.5     NO ORAL OR WRITTEN INFORMATION OR ADVICE GIVEN BY ESF OR AN ESF AUTHORIZED 
REPRESENTATIVE SHALL CREATE A WARRANTY. SHOULD THE WEB APPLICATION SOFTWARE 
OR THIRD-PARTY SERVICES PROVE DEFECTIVE, YOU ASSUME THE ENTIRE COST OF ALL 
NECESSARY REMEDIES OR CORRECTION.  
 
8. Limitation of Liability. TO THE EXTENT NOT PROHIBITED BY APPLICABLE LAW, IN NO EVENT 
SHALL ESF BE LIABLE FOR ANY INCIDENTAL, SPECIAL, INDIRECT OR CONSEQUENTIAL 
DAMAGES WHATSOEVER, INCLUDING, WITHOUT LIMITATION, DAMAGES FOR LOSS OF 
PROFITS, CORRUPTION OR LOSS OF DATA, FAILURE TO TRANSMIT OR RECEIVE ANY DATA, 
BUSINESS INTERRUPTION OR ANY OTHER COMMERCIAL DAMAGES OR LOSSES, ARISING OUT 
OF OR RELATED TO YOUR USE OR INABILITY TO USE THE WEB APPLICATION SOFTWARE AND 
SERVICES OR ANY THIRD-PARTY SOFTWARE OR APPLICATIONS IN CONJUNCTION WITH THE 
WEB APPLICATION SOFTWARE OR THIRD-PARTY SERVICES, HOWEVER CAUSED, REGARDLESS 
OF THE THEORY OF LIABILITY (CONTRACT, TORT OR OTHERWISE) AND EVEN IF ESF HAS BEEN 
ADVISED OF THE POSSIBILITY OF SUCH DAMAGES. In no event shall ESF be liable for monetary 
damages. The foregoing limitations will apply even if the above stated remedy fails of its essential 
purpose. 
 
9. Digital Certificates. The Web Application Software contains normal web functionality that allows it to 
use 2048 bit digital certificates issued for ESF by third parties. YOU ARE SOLELY RESPONSIBLE FOR 
DECIDING WHETHER OR NOT TO RELY ON A CERTIFICATE ISSUED FOR ESF BY A THIRD 
PARTY. YOUR USE OF DIGITAL CERTIFICATES IS AT YOUR SOLE RISK. TO THE MAXIMUM 
EXTENT PERMITTED BY APPLICABLE LAW, ESF MAKES NO WARRANTIES OR 
REPRESENTATIONS, EXPRESS OR IMPLIED, AS TO MERCHANTABILITY OR FITNESS FOR ANY 
PARTICULAR PURPOSE, ACCURACY, SECURITY, OR NON-INFRINGEMENT OF THIRD PARTY 
RIGHTS WITH RESPECT TO DIGITAL CERTIFICATES. Although encrypted data sent with a 2048 bit 
digital certificate may be deemed by many to be safe and not decryptable in transit with modern 
computing hardware, there is no guarantee that encrypted data sent with a 2048 bit digital certificate 
today, captured in transit and stored by a third-party will not be decryptable later with computing hardware 
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either currently under development or developed in the future by Governmental or non-Governmental 
entities. 
 
10. Access Outside The US. You may not use the Web Application Software except as authorized by 
United States law and the laws of the jurisdiction(s) in which the Web Application Software is accessed. 
In particular, but without limitation, the Web Application Software may not be accessed within any U.S. 
embargoed countries or by anyone on the U.S. Treasury Department's list of Specially Designated 
Nationals or the U.S. Department of Commerce Denied Person’s List or Entity List. By using the Web 
Application Software, you represent and warrant that you are not located in any such country or on any 
such list. You also agree that you will not use the Web Application Software for any purposes prohibited 
by United States law. 
 
11. Government End Users. The Web Application Software and related documentation are "Commercial 
Items", as that term is defined at 48 C.F.R. §2.101, consisting of "Commercial Computer Software" and 
"Commercial Computer Software Documentation", as such terms are used in 48 C.F.R. §12.212 or 48 
C.F.R. §227.7202, as applicable. Consistent with 48 C.F.R. §12.212 or 48 C.F.R. §227.7202-1 through 
227.7202-4, as applicable, the Commercial Computer Software and Commercial Computer Software 
Documentation are being licensed to U.S. Government end users (a) only as Commercial Items and (b) 
with only those rights as are granted to all other end users pursuant to the terms and conditions herein. 
Unpublished-rights reserved under the copyright laws of the United States. 
 
12. Controlling Law and Severability. This License will be governed by and construed in accordance with 
the laws of the State of Florida, excluding its conflict of law principles. If for any reason a court of 
competent jurisdiction finds any provision, or portion thereof, to be unenforceable, the remainder of this 
License shall continue in full force and effect.   
 
13. Complete Agreement; Governing Language. This License constitutes the entire agreement between 
you and ESF relating to the Web Application Software and supersedes all prior or contemporaneous 
understandings regarding such subject matter. No amendment to or modification of this License will be 
binding unless in writing and signed by ESF.  
 
14. Third Party Acknowledgements.  
(a) Portions of the Web Application Software may utilize or include third-party software and other 
copyrighted material. Acknowledgements, licensing terms and disclaimers for such material are contained 
within this document for the Web Application Software, and your use of such material is governed by their 
respective terms.  
 
(b) The PHP-Login MVC framework is a free open source framework for private or commercial projects 
and is licensed under a MIT license as follows: THE SOFTWARE IS PROVIDED "AS IS", WITHOUT 
WARRANTY OF ANY KIND, EXPRESS OR IMPLIED, INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO THE 
WARRANTIES OF MERCHANTABILITY, FITNESS FOR A PARTICULAR PURPOSE AND 
NONINFRINGEMENT. IN NO EVENT SHALL THE AUTHORS OR COPYRIGHT HOLDERS BE LIABLE 
FOR ANY CLAIM, DAMAGES OR OTHER LIABILITY, WHETHER IN AN ACTION OF CONTRACT, 
TORT OR OTHERWISE, ARISING FROM, OUT OF OR IN CONNECTION WITH THE SOFTWARE OR 
THE USE OR OTHER DEALINGS IN THE SOFTWARE. 
 
(c) The Twitter Bootstrap frontend is licensed under a MIT license as follows: 
The MIT License (MIT) Copyright (c) 2011-2014 Twitter, Inc 
Permission is hereby granted, free of charge, to any person obtaining a copy of this software and 
associated documentation files (the "Software"), to deal in the Software without restriction, including 
without limitation the rights to use, copy, modify, merge, publish, distribute, sublicense, and/or sell copies 
of the Software, and to permit persons to whom the Software is furnished to do so, subject to the 
following conditions: 
 
The above copyright notice and this permission notice shall be included in all copies or substantial 
portions of the Software. 
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THE SOFTWARE IS PROVIDED "AS IS", WITHOUT WARRANTY OF ANY KIND, EXPRESS OR 
IMPLIED, INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO THE WARRANTIES OF MERCHANTABILITY, FITNESS 
FOR A PARTICULAR PURPOSE AND NONINFRINGEMENT. IN NO EVENT SHALL THE AUTHORS 
OR COPYRIGHT HOLDERS BE LIABLE FOR ANY CLAIM, DAMAGES OR OTHER LIABILITY, 
WHETHER IN AN ACTION OF CONTRACT, TORT OR OTHERWISE, ARISING FROM, OUT OF OR IN 
CONNECTION WITH THE SOFTWARE OR THE USE OR OTHER DEALINGS IN THE SOFTWARE. 
 
 
 
15. Communications. 
If ESF needs to contact you about the web application software usage, you consent to receive the notices 
by email using the address currently on file. You agree that any such notices that we send you 
electronically will satisfy any legal communication requirements. 
 
Revised February 3rd 2015 
 


